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Article abstract
Following the pathfinding work of Pentland, many 19th century Canadian historians have posited a
split labour market in the crucial period between 1850 and 1870. According to this view, the period
saw the creation of a landless proletariat, essential to the transformation of the country from an
agricultural and commercial to an industrial and capitalist economy. This nascent group was
divided along ethnic lines, English and Scottish workers gaining the skilled, and Irish workers the
unskilled, jobs .One inference would be that these internal divisions coupled with the high wages
paid to the more privileged workers allowed Canada to avoid a large measure of working-class
radi- calism, while the pool of skilled personnel allowed Canadian industries to avoid the high costs
of training. An examination of the 1861 and 1871 censuses in south-central Ontario, however,
suggests that immigrant Catholic and Protestant Irish were not concentrated in low-paid industrial
work, but in agriculture.
A computer-assisted survey of' 10,000 men with known occupations linked between the two
censuses provides evidence on a number of questions. The analysis of the data reveals the
following differences in the makeup of the male labour force between 1861 and 1871: a) the
proportion of Ontario-born rose from 27 percent to 40 percent, while the figures for Irish-born
dropped from 24 percent to 15 percent; the proportion ofScottish- and English-born remained
virtually the same; b) in occupational terms, there was a shift from labouring to farming and, to a
lesser extent, to artisanal and nonmanual professions; the overwhelming majority of farmers (84
percent in 1871) were owners rather than tenants; c) neither religion nor ethnicity determined
occupation ; except for a concentration of the Irish-born in labouring, the working population does
not appear to have been split along either ethnic or religious lines. A relatively high proportion of
Ontario-born workers (30 percent in 1861 and 25 percent in 1871) were farmers' sons; d) over the
period, differences among national groups in the occupational tables lessened, though Irish
Catholics continued to be overrepresented in the labouring category, and English-born in the
bourgeois and artisanal occupations. Though there were some occupational specializations among
ethnic groups, the concentrations were not suffi- ciently pronounced to support the view that the
working population was deeply split along ethnic lines; e) an analysis of occupation linked with age
suggests that there was no movement off the land, and therefore no proletarianization of the
population during the 1860s. On the contrary, there was an increase in the proportion of farmers
with age, and a decrease in the proportion of labourers. Each occupational group had a distinctive
pattern of growth with variations over time;f) record linkage between the two censuses permits
some conclusions on the question of occupational persistence. Nearly 90 percent of the farmers in
1861 listed the same profession a decade later, while just over a third of the labourers did the same.
Artisans, professionals and merchants/'manufac- turers, in that order, occupied the middle ground
in terms of persistence. Relatively few sons of farmers (7 percent) became either labourers or
artisans. The least persistent occupational category was clerical and other nonmanual workers,
only 30 percent of whom remained in the same type of work. The evidence suggests a high degree
cf occupational mobility over time, and an absence of rural depopulation or a crisis of agriculture;
g) mobility appears to have been more dependent upon occupation and much less upon age, except
for unskilled workers. Mobility was greatest below the age of 25, expeciallyfor labourers, but varied
less between the ages qf25 and54. Only artisans show much mobility above the last age. By
including ethnicity in the calculations, only one major phenomenon can be identified: Irish-Catholic
labourers had a greater tendency to remain in this category over time.
In an era when urban industrialization was gathering momentum, independent com- modity
production by family farmers also expanded, especially out oflabouring and into farming.
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